






































Point of information: System designers should be aware that re-banding (i.e. 
Nextel) is currently well along making available the entire 800 MHz spectrnm as 
well as portions of the 700 MHz band for public safety and equipment must be 
capable of supporting these and other spectrum bands. See www.FCC.gov for 
additional information. 

510.5 Installation requirements. The installation of the emergency responder 
radio coverage system shall be in accordance with Sections 510.5.l through 
510.5.4. 

5 l 0.5. l Approval prior to installation. No amplification system capable of 
operating on frequencies used by the Regional 800 MHz Radio System shall be 
installed without prior coordination and approval of the radio system licensee 
(Eastside Public Safety Communications Agency, www.epsca.com, (425) 556-
2515), and any such system must comply with any standards adopted by the 
King County Regional Communications Board. 

510.5.2 Minimum qualifications of personnel. The system designer, lead 
installation personnel, and personnel conducting radio system tests shall be 
qualified to perform the work. 

Design documents and all tests shall be documented and signed by a person in 
possession of a current FCC General Radio Telephone Operator License and a 
certificate or certification issued by one (1) of the following: 

1. Associated Public Safety Communications Officials International (APCO). 

2. National Association of Business and Education Radio (NABER). 

3. Personal Communications Industry Association (PCIA). 

4. Manufacturer of the equipment being installed. 

510.5.3 Acceptance test procedure. Acceptance testing for emergency responder 
radio amplification system is required, upon completion of installation. 

It is the building owner's responsibility to have the radio system tested by 
qualified personnel to ensure a minimum of 95 percent two-way coverage on 
each floor of the building. 

PoiJ1t of information. A ce11i:ficate of occupancy will not be iss_ued for any 
strncture if the building fails to comply with these provisions. 

20 



A report shall be submitted to the fire department at the conclusion of acceptance 
testing containing a floor plan and the signal strengths at each location tested and 
other relevant information. A representative of the fire department may oversee 
the acceptance test. Acceptance testing is also required whenever changes occur 
to the buHding that would materially change the original field performance test. 
The test procedure shall be conducted as follows: 

I. Each floor of the building shall be divided into a grid of approximately forty 
( 40) equal areas. 

2. Testing shaJJ use a two (2) watt. portable transceiver with speaker/microphone 
and flexible antenna (or any calibrated device which wi ll produce signal levels 
useable by the prescribed portable radio). Field strength testing instruments must 
have been calibrated within one Cl) year of the date of the acceptance test. Field 
strength testing instruments must be of the frequency selective type incorporating 
a flexible antenna similar to the ones used on the hand held transceivers. The 
City radio system manager may designate alternate methods of measming the 
signal level which satisfy appropriate levels of public safety coverage. 

3. A maximum of two (2) nonadjacent areas will be allowed to fail the test. 

4. In the event that three (3) of the areas fail the test. the floor may be divided 
into eighty (80) equal areas in order to be more statistically accurate. In such 
event. a maximum of four (4) nonadjacent areas will be allowed to fail the test. 
After the eighty (80) area test, if the system continues to fail, the building owner 
shalJ have the system altered to meet the 95 percent coverage requirement. 

5. A spot located approximately in the center of a grid area will be selected for 
the test. then the radio will be keyed to verify two-way communication to and 
from the outside of the building through the Regional 800 MHz Radio System. 
Once the spot has been selected, prospecting for a better spot within the grid area 
is not permitted. The gain values of all amplifiers shall be measured and the 
results kept on file with the building owner so that the measurements can be 
verified each year during the annual test. In the event that the measurement 
results become lost, the buiJding owner will be required to rerun the acceptance 
test to reestablish the gain values. 

6. The gain values of all amplifiers shall be measured and the test measurement 
results shall be kept on file with the building owner so that the measurements can 
be verified during annual tests. In the event that the measurement results become 
lost, the building owner shaU be required to rerun the acceptance test to 
reestablish the gain values. 

21 



7. As part of the installation, a spectrum analyzer or other sui.table test equipment 
shall be utilized to ensure spurious oscillations are not being generated by the 
subject signal booster. This test shall be conducted at time of installation and 
subsequent annual inspections. 

Point of information. While the foregoing implies manual measurement and 
recording, automated testing and recordingjs c_ertainly permitted soJong as a 
report can be produced documenting the signal strenglh (or average) in each test 
square. 

510.5.4 FCC Compliance. The emergency responder radio coverage system 
installation and components shall also comply with all applicable federal 
regulations including, but not limited to, FCC 47 DFR Pait 90.219. 

510.6 Maintenance. The emergency responder radio coverage system shall be 
maintained operational at all times in accordance with Sections 510.6. 1 through 
510.6.3. 

510.6. l Testing and proof of compliance. The emergency responder radio 
coverage system shall be inspected and tested annually, or whenever structural 
changes occur to the building that would materially change the original field 
performance test bv a consultant apprnved by the fire code official. The 
performance test shall include at minimum a floor plan and the signal strength in 
various locations of the building. 

Testing shall consist of the following: 

1. In-building coverage test as described in Section 510.5.3. 

2. Signal boosters shall be tested to _ensw·e that the gain is the same as it was 
upon initial installation and acceptance. 

3. Backup batteries and power supplies shall be tested under load of a period of 
one (I) hour to verify that they will properly operate during an actual power 
outage. If within the one- (1) hour test period the battery exhibits symptoms of 
failure, the test shall be extended for additional one-(1) hour periods until the 
integrity of the battery can be determined. 

4. All other active components shall be checked to verify operation within tbe 
manufacturer's specifications. 

22 



( . ..--.,) D i i I 1 ' ' ' ,, . I 
' ; f r. I ' I ' • 1 ~ 

. \ . ..... j; • -\ ~ 

5. At the conclusion of the testing, a rep01t, which shall verify compliance with 

Section 510.5.3 , shall be submitted to the fire code official no later than January 
30 of each year. 

510.6.2 Additional frequencies and change of frequencies. The building owner 

shaJl modify or expand the frequency range at their own expense in the event 
frequency changes are required by the rec or additional frequencies are made 
available by the FCC. Prior approval of a public safety radio coverage system on 
previous frequencies does not exempt this requirement. 

510.6.3 Identification. The emergency radio coverage system shall be identified 

by a sign located on or near the fire a1a1m.control panel stating 'This building is 
equipped with an Emergency Responder Radio Coverage System." 

510.6.4 Field testing. Police and fire personnel shall, at any time, have the right 

to enter onto the property to conduct its own field testing to be certain that the 
required level of radio coverage is present. 

N. A new definition is added to Section 602.1 to read as follo1.vs: 

POV/ER TAP. A listed device for indoor use consisting of an attachment 
plug on one end of a fle~dble cord and two or more reoeptaoles on the 
opposite end, and has overeurrent protection. 

GR. Section 803.1 is amended to read as follows: 

803 .1 General. The provisions of Section 803 .1.1 through 803 .1.3 shall 
be applicable to all occupancies. 

PS. New Section 803.1.3 is added to read as follows: 

803.1.3 Atrium furnishings. Atrium furnishings shall comply with 
Sections 803.1.3.1 and 803.1.3.2. 

803 .1.3 .1 Potential heat. Potential heat of combustible furnishings and 
decorative materials within atria shall not exceed 9,000 Btu per pound 
(20,934 Jig) when located within an area that is more than 20 feet (6,096 
mm) below ceiling-level sprinklers. 

803 .1.3 .2 Decorative materials. Decorative material in atria shall be 
noncombustible, flame resistant or treated with a flame retardant. 

iiJ:. New Section 901.4.~1 is added to read as follows: 

23 



0 r"" 1 0 l r.. : I\ I 
• j r 1 ~ 1 • l • 1. /.\ I \ I .._...,. I I \ ~ ; \ , __ 

901.4 . .§.1 Additions, change of use, alterations and repairs to buildings. 
Additions, change of use, alterations and repairs to buildings shall 
comply with this section. 

901.4 . .§.1.1 Additions or changes of use. Additions or changes of use to 
existing buildings which would result in a nonconforming building shall 
be brought up to current code requirements for fire protection systems. 

Exception: A one time exemption for additions to Group R, Division 3 
occupancies of up to 500 square feet is permitted without compliance 
with this section. This exemption shall be recorded with King County 
Records and Elections. 

901.4 . .§.1.2 Alterations and repairs. When the value of all alterations or 
repairs performed within a seventy month period exceeds 50% of the 
value of the building, then fire extinguishing systems, and fire detection 
systems shall be installed throughout the building if one would otherwise 
be required for the building if of new construction. The value of the 
building shall be as listed by the King County Assessor's Office or other 
acceptable method approved by the fire code official at the time of the 
first peimit application or first alteration or repair work performed. 
Buildings not listed with an appraised value shall utilize an alternate 
method of valuation prescribed by the fire code official. 

RU. Section 901.7 is amended to read as follows: 

901. 7 Systems out of service. Where a fire protection system is out of 
service, the fire department nnd the fire code official shall be notified 
immediately and, where required by the fire code official, the building 
shall either be evacuated or an approved fire watch shall be provided for 
all occupants left unprotected by the shut down until the fire protection 
system has been returned to service. Where utilized, fire watches shall be 
provided with at least one approved means for notification of the fire 
department and their only duty shall be to perform constant patrols of the 
protected premises and keep watch for fires. 

SV. Section 903.2 is amended to read as follows: 

903 .2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new 
buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described in 
this section. 

24 

. .. 



0 rJ( I f' I T-. I l1 1 

, ILJ·· t''' i\I I I '/ /-

+w. New Section 903.2.13 is added to read as follows: 

903.2.13 All buildings. All newly constructed buildings shall comply 
with this section. 

903 .2.13 .1 Gross square footage. All newly constructed buildings with a 
gross square footage of 4,800 or greater square feet, regardless of type or 
use as well as zero lot line townhouses with an aggregate area of all 
connected townhouses equaling 4,800 square feet or greater shall be 
sprinklered. 

903.2.13.2 Fire flow. All buildings requiring 2000 gallons per minute or 
more fire flow shall be sprinklered. 

903 .2.13 .3 Group R Division 3. Group R, Division 3 occupancies shall 
be provided with an automatic sprinkler system if adequate fire flow, or 
hydrant spacing, or approved fire department access is not provided as 
defined in IFC Sections 503 and 507. 

Exception: Up to two (2) Group R, Division 3 occupancy buildings less 
than 2,500 gross square feet (including attached garages) shall be exempt 
from this section. 

YX. Sections 903.4.2 and 903.4.3 are-is amended to read as follows: 

. ...... 

1. 903 .4 .2 Alarms .• Approved audible and visible alaflll notification 
applianoes shall be connected to e't'ery automatio sprinkler system in 
acoordanoe with Seotion 907 and throughout areas designated by the fire 
code official. Sprinkler water flow alarm devices shall be activated by 
water flo'tV equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest 
orifice si:le installed in the system. Alarm devices shall be proYided on 
the eJ{terior of the building in an approved looation. Where a fire alarm 
system is installed, actuation of the automatio sprinkler system shall 
actuate the building fire alarm system. 

EJceeption: ·with approval of the fire code official, audible and visible 
alaflll notification applianoes may be omitted for approved residential 
sprinkler systems in one or two dwelling units if not otherwise 
specifically required. 

~ 903.4.3 Floor control valves. Approved supervised indicating control 
valves shall be provided at the point of connection to the riser on each 
floor. 

25 

. • 



Exception: When approved by the fire code official in NFPA 13D and 
NFPA 13R Systems. 

¥Y. Section 904.11 is amended to read as follows: 

904.11 Commercial cooking systems. The automatic fire-extinguishing 
system for commercial cooking systems shall be of a type recognized for 
protection of commercial cooking equipment and exhaust system of the 
type and arrangement protected. Pre-engineered automatic dry- and wet­
chemical extinguishing systems shall be tested in accordance with UL 
300 nnd listed and labeled for specific use as protection for commercial 
cooking operations. The system shall be installed in accordance with this 

code, its listing and the manufacturer's installation instructions. 
Automatic fire-extinguishing systems of the following types shall be 
installed in accordance with the referenced standard indicated, as 

follows: 

1. Carbon dioxide extinguishing systems, NFP A 12. 

2. Automatic sprinkler systems, NFP A 13. 

3. Foam-water sprinkler system or foam-water spray systems, NFPA 16. 

4. Dry-chemical extinguishing systems, NFP A 17. 

5. Wet chemical extinguishing systems, NFP A 17 A. 

Exceptions: 

1. Factory-built comm0rcial cooking recirculating systems that are tested 
in accordance with UL 197 or 71 OB and listed, labeled and installed in 

accordance with Section 304.1 of the International Mechanical Code. 

WZ. New Section 905.3.&.2 is added to read as follows: 

90S.3.&.2High-rise building standpipes. Standpipe risers shall be 
combination standpipe/sprinkler risers using a minimum pipe size of 6-
inch. Two 2 112-inch hose connections shall be provided on every 
intermediate floor level landing in every required stairway. Where 
pressure reduction valves (PRV) are required, each hose connection shall 
be provided with its own PRV. The system shall be designed to provide a 
minimum flow of 300 gpm at a minimum pressure of 150 psi (maximum 
200 psi) at each standpipe connection, in addition to the flow and 

pressure requirements contained in NFP A 14. 

26 

.. -··-.... 



CJ i·\ i,) 
AA. Section 905.4 is amended to read as follows: 

905.4 Location of Class I standpipe hose connections. Class I standpipe hose 
connections shall be provided in all of the following locations: 

l. In everv requiJed stairway. a hose connection shall be provided for each floor 
level above or below grade. Hose connections shall be located at an intermediate 
floor level landing between floors. Where stairs are required to provide roof 
access, the standpipe roof connections shall be located adjacent to the stair 

opening on the roof. 

2. On each side of the wan adjacent to the exit opening of a horizontal exit. 

Exceptions: 

1. Where floor areas adjacent to a horizontal exit are reachable from exit 
stairway hose com1ections by a 30-foot (9144 mm) hose stream from a nozzle 
attached to 100 feet (30 480 mm) of hose, a hose connection shall not be required 

at the horizontal exit. 

2. When the fire code official determines that a standpipe connection is not 

needed. 

6. Where the most remote portion of a nonsprinklered floor or story is more than 
150 feet ( 45 720 mm) from a hose connection or the most remote portion of a 
sprinklered floor or story is more than 150 feet (45 720 mm) from a hose 
connection, the fire code official is authorized to require t hat additional hose 
connections be provided in approved locations. 

X. £ection 906.1 is amended to read as follows: 

906.1 Where required. Portable fire eJ(tinguishers shall be installed in the 

follO'tving locations: 

1. In all Group A, B, E, F, H, I, M, R 1, R 2, R 4 and£ occupancies. 

2. Within 3 0 feet (9114 mm) of commercial cooking equipment. 

3. In areas vihere flammable or combustible liquids are stored, used or 

dispensed. 

4. On each floor of structures under construction, e1rnept Group R 3 
occupancies, in accordance with £ection 1415 .1. 

27 

_·.~ ........ 



O R \ G \ l\J /~ L 
5. Where required by the sections indicated in Table 906.1. 

6. gpeoial hazard areas, including but not limited to laboratories, 
computer rooms and generator rooms, 'Nhere required by the fire code 
official. 

¥BB. New Section 907.2.24 is added to read as follows: 

907.2.24 All buildings. All newly constructed buildings with a gross 
square footage of 3,000 or greater shall be provided with an approved 
automatic and manual fire alarm system. 

Exceptions: 

A. Group R Division 3 and 4, and Group U Occupancies having 
adequate fire flow and approved access. 

B. Group R Division 3 and 4 dwelling units shall have interconnected 
single station smoke detectors in accordance with RCW 48.48.140 and 
WAC 212-10. 

:6CC. New Section 907.2.25 is added to read as follows: 

907.2.25 Remodels and tenant improvements. When undergoing remodel 
and tenant improvements, existing occupancies equipped with smoke 
detectors that are 10 or more years old shall have all such detectors 
replaced with modem units. Those occupancies without the protection of 
smoke detection shall add smoke detection in accordance with the 
applicable requirements in the International Residential Code or 
International Building Code. 

DD. New Section 907.2.26 is added to read as follows: 

907.2.26 Alarm panel beyond repair. When an alarm panel i beyond repair and 
parts are not available, a new alarm panel shall be required. Installation of the 
new alarm panel shall be in accordance with Section 907. 

EE. Section 1103.2 is amended to read as follows: 

1103.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings. Buildings 

constructed prior to the implementation of this code shall.not be required to 
comply with the emergency responder radio coverage provisions except as 
follows: 

28 

. . ....... 



{.._f r "\ ! 

I . I i ' ' ' ' I 
l. / l 1 I : . ' I I 

I _, ; • ' : ' I 

1. Whenever an e ·isting wired communication system cannot be repaired or is 
being replaced. 

2. Buildings identified in Section 510.1 undergoing substantial alteration as 
determined by the fire code official. 

3. When buildings. classes of buildings, or specific occupancies do not have 
minimum radio coverage -signal strength as identified in Section 510.4.1 and the 
fire code official determines that lack of minimum signal strength poses an 
undue risk to emergency responders that cannot be reasonably mitigated by other 
means. 

FF. Sections 1103.8 and 1103.8.1 are amended to read as follows: 

1. l 103.8 Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms. Single- and multiple-station 
smoke alarms shall be installed in existing Group I-1 and R occupancies in 
accordance with Sections 1103.8.1through1103.8.3. 

2. 1103.8. l Where required. Existing Group I-1 and R occupancies shall be 
provided with single-station smoke alanns in accordance with Section 907 .2.11, 
except as provided in Sections 1103.8.2 and 1103.8.3. 

Exception: Where smoke detectors connected to a fire alarm system have been 
installed as a substitute for smoke alarms. 

AA. gection 1404.5 is amended to read as follmvs: 

14 04. 5 Fire 'Natch. When required by the fire code official for building 
construction or demolition that is hazardous in nature, qualified 
personnel shall be provided to serve as an onsite fire \Vatch. Fire watch 
personnel shall be provided with at least one approved means for 
notification of the fire department and their sole duty shall be to perform 
constant patrols and watch for the occurrence of fire. 

BBGG. Section 2703.95003.9 is amended to read as follows: 

.... ----

2703.95003.9 General safety precautions. General precautions for the 
safe storage, handling or care of hazardous materials shall be in 
accordance with Sections 2703.9.15003.9.1through2703.9.105003.9.11. 

29 



r) r:-; r~ 
l_.) : \ i. j 

GGHH. New Section 2703.9.115003.9.11 is added to read as follows: 

2703.9.115003.9.ll Manufacturer's Limitations. The storage and use of 

hazardous materials shall not exceed the manufacturer's limitations on 

shelf life and any other restrictions on use. 

~ • f\ l • ~ I 

\ \ ! 1 \ •• • 

OOII. Sections 3204.3.1.1.35504.3.1.1.3, 3404 .2.9.6.15704.2.9.6.1, 3406.2.4.45-706.2.4.4, 

and 3804.26104.2 are amended to read as follows: designate the applicable areas as the 

city of Shoreline, except as allov.<ed by the fire code official. 

1.. .. 5.5.0~.3.1 . l .3 Loc.ation. Amended to designate the applicable areas as 

the City of Shoreline, except as allowed by the fire code official. 

2. 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tai1ks are prohibited. 

Amended to designate the applicable areas as the City of Shoreline, 

except as allowed by the fire code official. 

3. 5706.2.4.4Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. 

Amended to designate the applicable areas as the City of Shoreline. 

except as allowed by the fire code official. 

4. 6J 04.2 Maximwn capacity within established limits. Amended to 

designate the applicable areas as the City of Shoreline, except as allowed 

by the fire code official. 

30 



EXHIBITS 

Section 15.05.070 is amended to read as follows: 

15.05.070 International Property Maintenance Code amendments. 

* * * [A - C unchanged] 

D. Section 108.7 is amended to read as follows: 

108. 7 Relocation assistance. If a rental dwelling or portion of a dwelling or its 
premises is declared condemned or unlawful to occupy and is required to be vacated, 
the landlord, who knew or should have known of the existence of these conditions, 
shall be required to pay relocation assistance and any prepaid deposit and prepaid rent 
to the displaced tenants in accordance with the Revised Code of Washington (RCW) 
59.18.085. The City shall advance relocation assistance funds, prepaid deposit and 
prepaid rent to eligible tenants as set forth in RCW 59.18.085 in the event the 
landlord fails to pay the relocation assistance as required. 

* * * [E-1 unchanged] 

J. Section 302.8 is amended to read as follows: 

302.8 Motor vehicles, recreational vehicles, and boats. Except as provided for in other 
regulations, no inoperative or unlicensed motor vehicle, recreational vehicle or boat shall 
be parked, kept or stored on any premises, and no vehicle, recreational vehicle or boat 
shall at any time be in a state of major disassembly, disrepair, damaged to the extent it 
prevents normal operation, or in the process of being stripped or dismantled. Every 
motor vehicle, recreational vehicle or boat parked, kept or stored on any premises shall 
display current and valid registration tabs properly mounted in accordance with State of 
Washington rules and regulations. Painting of vehicles and boats is prohibited unless 
conducted inside an approved spray booth. 

* * * [K - L unchanged] 

31 

--


