ORIGINAL

ORDINANCE NO. 477

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SHORELINE, WASHINGTON AMENDING
THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL
CODE and INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AND AMENDING SECTIONS
15.05.010, 15.05.030, 15.05.040 AND 15.05.050 OF THE SHORELINE
MUNICIPAL CODE

WHEREAS, Chapter 15.05 of the Shoreline Municipal Code adopts all building
and construction codes, as amended by the State Building Code Council, for the City of
Shoreline, including the International Building Code (“IBC”), the International
Residential Code (“IRC”), and the International Fire Code (“IFC”);

WHEREAS, City of Shoreline staff has reviewed the IBC and the IRC as adopted
by the City of Shoreline and is proposing amendments in order to ensure consistency with
the Shoreline Development Code; and

WHEREAS, the City of Shoreline staff and the and Shoreline Fire Department
have reviewed the IFC as adopted by the City of Shoreline and are proposing
amendments in order to improve fire safety;

NOW THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SHORELINE, WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Amendment. Shoreline Municipal Code Section 15.05.010,
Adoption of referenced codes, is hereby amended as set forth in Exhibit 1, which is
attached hereto and incorporated herein.

Section 2. Amendment. Shoreline Municipal Code Section 15.05.030,
International Building Code amendments, is hereby amended as set forth in Exhibit 2,
which is attached hereto and incorporated herein.

Section 3. Amendment. Shoreline Municipal Code Section 15.05.040,
International Residential Code amendments, is hereby amended as set forth in Exhibit 3,
which is attached hereto and incorporated herein.

Section 4. Amendment. Shoreline Municipal Code Section 15.05.050.
International Fire Code amendments, is hereby amended as set forth in Exhibit 4, which
is attached hereto and incorporated herein.

Section 5. Severability. Should any section, paragraph, sentence, clause or
phrase of this ordinance, or its application to any person or circumstance, be declared
unconstitutional or otherwise invalid for any reason, or should any portion of this
ordinance be preempted by state or federal law or regulation, such decision or preemption
shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance or its application
to other persons or circumstances.



ORIGINAL

Section 6. Effective Date and Publication. A summary of this ordinance
consisting of the title shall be published in the official newspaper and the ordinance shall
take effect five days after publication.

oy
t
3

i

H

&

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL ON DECEMBER 10, 2007.

ATTEST: D O FORM:

/% Vo)
Scott PassU [an Sievers/
City Clerk City Attorney

Date of publication: December 13, 2007
Effective date: December 18, 2007

‘l“%-,w’l

[Eme———y



ORIGINAL

EXHIBIT 1

-

15.05.010 Adoption of referenced codes.

The city of Shoreline hereby adopts the following codes for the purpose of
establishing rules and regulations for the construction, alteration, removal,
demolition, equipment, use and occupancy, location and maintenance of
buildings, premises and structures, including permits and penalties:

A. The current edition of the International Building Code published by the
International Code Council, Inc., as adopted by the Washington State Building
Code Council in Chapter 51-50 WAC, as now or hereafter amended.

B. The current edition of the International Residential Code published by the
International Code Council, Inc., as adopted by the Washington State Building
Code Council in Chapter 51-51 WAC, as now or hereafter amended.

C. The current edition of the International Mechanical Code published by the
International Code Council, Inc., as adopted by the Washington State Building
Code Council in Chapter 51-52 WAC, as now or hereafter amended, except that
the standards for liquefied petroleum gas installations shall be NFPA 58 (Storage
and Handling of Liquefied Petroleum Gases) and ANSI Z223.1/NFPA 54
(National Fuel Gas Code).

D. The current edition of the International Fuel Gas Code published by the
International Code Council, Inc., as adopted by the Washington State Building
Code Council in Chapter 51-52 WAC, as now or hereafter amended. The
following appendix is specifically adopted: Appendix A, Sizing Capacities of Gas
Piping.

E. The current edition of the International Fire Code, published by the
International Code Council, Inc., as adopted by the Washington State Building
Code Council in Chapter 51-54 WAC, as now or hereafter amended, including
those standards of the National Fire Protection Association specifically
referenced in the International Fire Code; provided, that notwithstanding any
wording in this code, participants in religious ceremonies shall not be precluded
from carrying hand-held candles. The following appendices are specifically
adopted:

3_1. Appendix E, Hazard Categories;
4 2. Appendix F, Hazard Ranking.

F. Except as provided in RCW 19.27.170, the current edition of the Uniform
Plumbing Code and Uniform Plumbing Code Standards, published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, as adopted by
the Washington State Building Code Council in Chapters 51-56 and 51-57 WAC,
as now or hereafter amended; provided, that any provisions of such code
affecting sewers or fuel gas piping are not adopted. The following appendices are
specifically adopted:

1. Appendix A, Recommended Rules for Sizing the Water Supply System;



ORIGINAL

2. Appendix B, Explanatory Notes on Combination Waste and Vent
Systems; -

84. Appendix |, Installation Standards.

G. The rules adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council
establishing standards for making buildings and facilities accessible to and
usable by the physically disabled or elderly persons, as provided in RCW
70.92.100 through 70.92.160.

H. The current edition of the Washington State Energy Code, as adopted by
the State Building Code Council in Chapter 51-11 WAC, as now or hereafter
amended.

I. The current edition of the Washington State Ventilation and Indoor Air
Quality Code, as adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council in
Chapter 51-13 WAC, as now or hereafter amended.

J. The 2005 National Electric Code, published by the National Fire Protection
Association, as adopted by the Department of Labor and Industries in Chapter
296-46B WAC, as now or hereafter amended, and Chapter 19.28 RCW, as now
or hereafter amended.

K. The 2003 International Property Maintenance Code published by the
International Code Council as amended and filed under city clerk’s receiving
number 3505.

H
‘
i

¢
‘. :
k’%«;i".



1

ORIGINAL

EXHIBIT 2

5.05.030 International Building Code amendments.

A. Section 105.2, Work exempt from permit.
1. Section 105.2(1) is amended to read as follows:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage
sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not
exceed 200 square feet (18.33 m?)

4 2. Section 105.2(6) is amended to read as follows:

6. Platforms, sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm)
above grade and not over any basement or story below and which are not
part of an accessible route.

2 3. Section 105.2(14) is added to read as follows:
14. Re-roofing of existing buildings where there are no structural elements

being revised or replaced including the roof diaphragm.

B. Section 1612.3, Establishment of flood hazard areas, is amended to read as

follows: :

To establish flood hazard areas, the governing body shall adopt a flood
hazard map and supporting data. The flood hazard map shall include, at a
minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified by the Federal
Emergency Management Agency in an engineering report entitled “The
Flood Insurance Study for the City of Shoreline,” dated March 4, 1997, as
amended or revised with the accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map
(FIRM) and Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related
supporting data along with any revisions thereto. The adopted flood
hazard map and supporting data are hereby adopted by reference and
declared to be part of this section.

C. Section 3002.4, Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher, is

amended to read as follows:

Where elevators are provided in buildings, four or more stories above above
grade plane or four or more stories below grade plane, or any R occupancy
buildings with elevators serving one or more stories above or below ground
access, at least one elevator shall be provided for fire department emergency




ORIGINAL

access to all floors. The elevator car shall be such a size and arrangement to
accommodate a 24-inch by 84-inch (610 mm by 1930 mm) ambulance
stretcher in the horizontal, open position and shall be identified by the
international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The symbol
shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) high and shall be placed inside on
both sides of the hoistway door frame.

e d

N

Mg



EXHIBIT 3

15.05.040 International §e§identia| Code amendments.

A. Section 105.2, Work exempt from permit.
1. Section 105.2(1) is amended to read as follows:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage
sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not
exceed 200 square feet (18.33 m?)

1 2. Section 105.2(6) is amended to read as follows:

6. Platforms, sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm)
above grade and not over any basement or story below and which are not
part of an accessible route.

2 3. Section 105.2(10) is added to read as follows:

10. Re-roofing of existing buildings where there are no structural elements
being revised, including the roof diaphragm.

B. Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria, is amended to
read as foliows:

Table R301.2(1)
Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria

Roof Snow Load 25 Ibs/sq ft
Wind Speed 85 mph
Seismic Design Category D2
Weathering Moderate
Frost Line Depth 12"
Termites : Slight to Moderate
Decay Slight to Moderate
Winter Design Temp 27 degrees
Ice Shield Underlayment Required No
Flood Hazards *
’ Air Freeze Index 113
Mean Annual Temp 53 degrees

*1. Date of ordinance adoption: March 4, 1997.




ORIGINAL

2. Map effective date: May 15, 1995.

.
d

hvm'w



JRIGINAL

EXHIBIT 4

15.05.050 International l;iré Code amendments.

A. Section 102.6 is amended to read as follows:

102.6 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards
referenced in this code shall be those that are listed in Chapter 45. Such
codes and standards shall be considered part of the requirements of this
code to the prescribed extent of each such reference as determined or
modified by the fire chief. Where differences occur between the provisions
of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions of this code shall

apply.

B. Sections 104.1, 104.10.1, and 104.11.2 are amended to read as follows:

1. 104.1 General. The City Manager or his/her designee is hereby
authorized to enforce the provisions of this code, and to adopt policies,
procedures, rules and regulations in order to clarify the application of its
provision. Wherever this code refers to the fire code official it shall be
construed to mean the City Manager or his/her designee. Such
interpretations, policies, procedures, rules and regulations shall be in
compliance with the intent and purpose of this code and shall not have the
effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in this code.

2. 104.10.1 Assistance from other agencies. Police and other enforcement
agencies shall have authority to render necessary assistance in the
investigation of fires or the enforcement of this code when requested to do
so by the fire chief or his/her designee.

3. 104.11.2 Obstructing operations. No person shall obstruct the
operations of the fire department in connection with extinguishment,
control, or investigation of any fire, or actions relative to other
emergencies, or disobey any lawful command of the fire chief or officer of
the fire department in charge of the emergency, or any part thereof, or any
lawful order of a police officer assisting the fire department.

C. New Section 105.7.14 is added to read as follows:

105.7.14 Emergency Power Supblv System. A construction permit is
required for the installation of Emergency Power Supply Systems required
, by Section 604.

€ D. Sections 109.3 and 111.4 are hereby repealed.



ORIGINAL B

|
i
]

E. Section 308.3.7 is amended to read as follows:

308.3.7 Group A occupancies. Open-flame devices shall not be used in a
Group A occupancy.

;\x.y;l

Exceptions:

1. Open-flame devices are allowed to be used in the following
situations, provided approved precautions are taken to prevent ignition
of a combustible material or injury to occupants:

1.1. Where necessary for ceremonial or religious purposes in
accordance with Section 308.3.5. :

10

i ¢
pY



ORIGINAL

1.2. On stages and platforms as a necessary part of a performance in
accordance with Section 308.3.6.

1.3. Where candles on tables are securely supported on substantial
noncombustible bases and the candle flames are protected.

2. Heat-producing equipment complying with Chapter 6 and the
International Mechanical Code.

3. Gas lights are allowed to be used provided adequate precautions
satisfactory to the fire code official are taken to prevent ignition of
combustible materials.

4. Where approved by the fire code official {see-also-308-3-1-2)-

F. Section 314.4 is amended to read as follows:

314 .4 Vehicles. Liquid- or gas-fueled vehicles, fueled equipment, boats or
other motorcraft shall not be located indoors except as follows:

1. Batteries are disconnected.

2. Fuel in fuel tanks does not exceed one-quarter tank or 5 gallons (19 L)
(whichever is least).

3. Fuel tanks and fill openings are closed and sealed to prevent
tampering.

4. Vehicles, boats or other motorcraft, or fueled equipment are not fueled
or defueled within the building.

G. State amendments for Sections 503.1, 503.1.1, 503.1.2, 503.1.3, 503.2,
503.3, and 503.4 are hereby repealed.
H. Sections 508.3 and ,508.5.1 and 508.5.4 are amended to read as follows:

1. 508.3 Fire flow. Fire flow requirements for buildings or portions of

buildings and facilities shall be determined by-use-of AppendixB in
accordance with Sections 508.3.1 through 508.3.9.

- Exception:

' Fire Flow is not required for structures under 500 square feet with a B,
U or R-1 occupancy where structures are at least 30 feet from any
other structure and are used only for recreation.

11



ORIGINAL

2. 508.3.1 Minimum residual pressure. All required fire flow, either
temporary or permanent, shall not create a minimum residual pressure in
the public or private water system of less than 20 psi. (WAC 246-290-230)

3. 508.3.2 Required fire flow. The required quantity and demand duration
of water shall be equal to the calculated fire flow for the greatest hazard or
protected risk in the proposed development, and shall be determined by
the fire code official using Table B105.1 Appendix B of the International
Fire Code as the required baseline fire flow.

Exceptions:

A. The fire code official may increase the fire-flow requirements where
conditions indicate an unusual susceptibility to group fires,
conflagrations, or other fire hazard to the community.

B. The minimum fire flow requirements for one- and two-family
dwellings having a fire-flow calculation area of 3,600 square feet or
less, shall be-1,000, gallons per minute.

C. Up to two (2) Group R, Division 3 occupancy buildings less than
2.500 gross sguare feet (including attached garages) shall be exempt
from this section.

4. 508.3.3 Infrastructure calculations. Where the existing fire flow on a
system is inadequate, or a new system is proposed, engineering design
calculations or an approved flow test when allowed by the water purveyor
may be required to verify fire flow.

5. 508.3.4. Where the required fire flow exceeds the available fire flow,
the installation or enhancement of automatic fire sprinkler and/or
automatic fire detection and alarm systems may be used in conjunction
with Section 508.3.5 when approved by the fire code official.

6. 508.3.5 Credit for automatic sprinkler systems. Fire flow credit for
automatic sprinkler protection shall be granted only when the entire
structure is protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system,
designed in accordance with NFPA-13 or NFPA-13R, and for single family
dwellings less than 4,800 sq. ft. in total area, designed in accordance with
NFEPA-13D.

508.3.5.1 Credit toward fire flow requirements shall be granted by the fire
code official where sprinklers are installed:

1. For the purposes of area or height increases as specified in the
International Building Code.

2. For the purposes of one-hour fire resistive substitution as specified
in the International Building Code.

12

v...;,,»
P |

o



NARIGINAL

3. In Group R, Division 3 occupancies, as a substitute for fire
apparatus access. _

508.3.5.2 There shall be no additional credit toward fire flow requirements
by installing an automatic sprinkler system where the system is required
by the International Building or Fire Codes to protect hazardous storage or
processes, or in any Group H or | occupancy

508.3.5.3 Fire flow credit allowed per type of sprinkler system:
1. The reduction allowed for a NFPA 13 designed system shall be 50

percent. _
2. The reduction allowed for a NFPA 13 R designed system shall be 30

percent.
3. The reduction allowed for ann NFPA 13 D designed system shall be 30

percent.

4. The reduction allowed may be increased by the fire code official when
the design area or density has been increased over the minimums set
forth by the applicable NFPA standard. This provision only applies to light
hazard occupancies.

7. 508.3.6 Fire-flow calculation area. The area used to calculate fire flow

sﬁall be
determined in accordance with this section.

508.3.6.1 The fire-flow calculation area shall be the total floor area of all floor
levels within the exterior walls, and under the horizontal projections of the roof

of a building.

508.3.6.2 Portions of buildings that are separated by four hour-fire walls
without openings, constructed in accordance with the International Building
Code, are allowed t_Q be considered as separate fire-flow calculation areas.

508.3.6.3 The fire-flow calculation area of a building constructed of Type IA
and Type IB construction shall be the area of the three largest successive
floors. '

Exception: Fire-flow calculation area for open parking garages shall be
determined by the area of the largest floor.

2 8. 508.5 Fire hydrant systems. Fire hydrant systems shall comply with
Sections 508.5.1 through 508.5.7.

13



’

ORIGINAL

508.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building
hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than
450 400 feet from-a any hydrant required to meet the building's fire flow,
on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route
around the exterior of the facility or building, onsite fire hydrants and
mains shall be provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement
shall be 359 500 feet. One and two family dwellings located beyond
the 500 feet are required to install a NFPA 13D sprinkler system.

2. For buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, or
903.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3 the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183
m).

508.5.1.1 Hydrant spacing and distribution. Fire hydrants installed for new
development shall be located as per fire flow requirements, approved by
the fire code official and comply with sections 508.5.1.1.1 through
508.5.1.1.5.

508.5.1.1.1 Buildings of less than 2500 gpm. Buildings having a required
fire flow less than two thousand five hundred (2500) gpm may have fire
hydrants on one side of the building only.

508.5.1.1.2 Buildings of 2500 gpm and less than 3500gpm. Buildings
having a required fire flow of two thousand five hundred (2500) gpm or
more and less than three thousand five hundred (3500) gpm shall have
hydrants served by a main that loops the building or complex of buildings
and reconnects back into a distribution supply main in a separate location.

Exception: Where property lines, topography or other features prevent
fire department vehicle access to one or more sides of a building or
complex of buildings, this requirement may be waived if suitable fire
protection features as approved by the fire code official are installed on

the premises.

508.5.1.1.3 Buildings of 3500 gpm or more. Buildings having a required
fire flow of three thousand five hundred (3500) gpm or more shall have
hydrants served by a main that loops the building or complex and that is
served from two directions or two sources of water supply.

508.5.1.1.4 Distance from buildings. For other than hazardous conditions,
fire hydrants shall be located at least fifty (50) feet from the building or
buildings they serve. When the materials or processes in a building or
complex of buildings constitute a hazardous condition as determined by

14

.
3
T

Iy

%o



ORIGINAL

the fire code official, hydrants shall be located no closer than eighty (80)
feet from the building. ~

Exception: Where property lines, topography or other features prevent
this spacing, fire hydrants may be located closer to the building or
buildings if suitable safeguards as approved by the fire code official are
provided to protect fire equipment and fire fighters using the hydrant.

508.5.1.1.5 Arterials. Where a project site is located on a divided or
primary arterial (traffic count of more than 20,000 vehicles per day),
required hydrants shall be located on the same side of the divided or
primary arterial as the project.

9. 508.5.4 Obstruction. Posts, fences, vehicles, growth, trash, storage
and other materials or objects shall not be placed or kept near fire
hydrants, fire department inlet connections or fire protection system
control valves in a manner that would prevent such equipment or fire
hydrants from being immediately discernible. There shall be no parking of
motor vehicles, refuse containers or other obstructions within fifteen (15)
feet of a hydrant measured along the street or curb from a point
perpendicular to the hydrant. The fire department shall not be deterred or
hindered from gaining immediate access to fire protection equipment or
fire hydrants. Paved access to fire hydrants shall be maintained to
accommodate fire fighting apparatus, and to prevent damage to
landscaping and pavement when the fire hydrant is being tested at its full
flow.

10. 508.5.4.1 Marking. Paved areas within the vicinity of a hydrant shall
be permanently marked by painting the words “NO PARKING” and striping
as approved by the fire code official. Fire hydrants located on private
property shall be marked with an approved, reflective hydrant marker
provided by the property owner placed in the street, alley, fire lane or
access route in a location specified by the fire code official.

I. New Section 508.5.7 is added to read as follows:

508.5.7.5 Number of fire hydrants required. The number of hydrants
required for a building or complex of buildings shall be based on the
formula:

Number of hydrants = required fire flow divided by 1500 gpm.

Fractions equal to or greater than one-half (1/2) shall be rounded up to the
next higher whole number. Fractions less than one-half (1/2) shall be

dropped.

Exception: Where actual fire flow tests performed in an approved manner
when allowed by the water purveyor show higher flows exist.

15



IRIGINAL

}J. A new definition is added to Section 602.1 to read as follows:

POWER TAP. A listed device for indoor use consisting of an attachment
plug on one end of a flexible cord and two or more receptacles on the
opposite end, and has overcurrent protection.

L K. New Section 901.4.5 is added to read as follows:

901.4.5 Additions, change of use, alterations and repairs to buildings.
Additions, change of use, alterations and repairs to buildings shall comply
with this section.

901.4.5.1 Additions or changes of use. Additions or changes of use to
existing buildings which would result in a nonconforming building shall be
brought up to current code requirements for fire protection systems.

Exception: A one time exemption for additions to Group R, Division 3
occupancies of up to 500 square feet is permitted without compliance with
this section. This exemption shall be recorded with King County Records
and Elections.

»

901.4.5.2 Alterations and repairs. When the value of all alterations or
repairs performed within a seventy month period exceeds 50% of the
value of the building, then fire extinguishing systems, and fire detection
systems shall be installed throughout the building if one would otherwise

16

3
L
M
%
3

N



IRIGINAL

be required for the building if of new construction. The value of the
building shall be as listed by the King County Assessor’s Office or other
acceptable method approved by the fire code official at the time of the first
permit application or first alteration or repair work performed. Buildings not
listed with an appraised value shall utilize an alternate method of valuation
prescribed by the fire code official.

M L. Sections-804-6-1and 901.7 are is amended to read as follows:

'2-901.7 Systems out of service. Where a fire protection system is out of
service, the fire department and the fire code official shall be notified
immediately and, where required by the fire code official, the building shall
either be evacuated or an approved fire watch shall be provided for all
occupants left unprotected by the shut down until the fire protection
system has been returned to service. Where utilized, fire watches shall be
provided with at least one approved means for notification of the fire
department and their only duty shall be to perform constant patrols of the
protected premises and keep watch for fires.

N M. Section 903.2 is amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new
buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described in this
section.

O N. New Section 903.2.14 is added to read as follows:

903.2.14 All buildings. All newiy constructed buildings shall comply with
this section.

903.2.14.1 Gross square footage. All newly constructed buildings with a
gross square footage of 5,000 or greater square feet, regardless of type or
use as well as zero lot line townhouses with an aggregate area of all
connected townhouses equaling 5,000 square feet or greater shall be
sprinklered.

903.2.14.2 Fire flow. All buildings requiring 2000 galions per minute or
more fire flow shall be sprinklered.

17



IRIGINAL

903.2.14.3 Group R Division 3. Group R, Division 3 occupancies shall be
provided with an automatic sprinkler system if adequate fire flow, or
hydrant spacing, or approved fire department access is not provided as
defined in IFC Sections 503, Appendix-B,-Appendix-C-and-the-Gity-of
Shoreline-Engineering-Development-Guide and 508.

Exception: Up to two (2) Group R, Division 3 occupancy buildings less
than 2,500 gross square feet (including attached garages) shall be exempt
from this section.

P Q. Sections 903.4.2 and 903.4.3 are amended to read as follows:

1. 903.4.2 Alarms. Approved audible and visible alarm notification
appliances shall be connected to every automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 907 and throughout areas designated by the fire
code official. Sprinkler water-flow alarm devices shall be activated by
water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice
size installed in the system. Alarm devices shall be provided on the
exterior of the building in an approved location. Where a fire alarm system
is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the
building fire alarm system.

Exception: With approval of the fire code official, audible and visible alarm
notification appliances may be omitted for approved residential sprinkler
systems in one or two dwelling units if not otherwise specifically required.

[E——————

2. 903.4.3 Floor control valves. Approved supervised indicating control
valves shall be provided at the point of connection to the riser on each
floor.

Exception: When approved by the fire code official in NFPA 13D and
NFPA 13R Systems.

Q P. Section 904.11 is amended to read as follows:

904 11 CommerC|aI cookmg systems %astmg—ﬁre—suppress;en—systems

- ~The automatlc f ire- V)
extinguishing system for commercial cooking systems shall be of a type ht
recognized for protection of commercial cooking equipment and exhaust
system of the type and arrangement protected. Pre-engineered automatic

* dry- and wet-chemical extinguishing systems shall be tested in
accordance with UL 300 and listed and labeled for specific use as
protection for commercial cooking operations. The system shall be
installed in accordance with this code, its listing and the manufacturer's
installation instructions. Automatic fire-extinguishing systems of the

vt

F

18 P



IRIGINAL

following types shall be installed in accordance with the referenced
standard indicated, asfollows:

1. Carbon dioxide extinguishing systems, NFPA 12.

2. Automatic sprinkler systems, NFPA 13.

3. Foam-water sprinkler system or foam-water spray systems, NFPA 16.
4. Dry-chemical extinguishing systems, NFPA 17.

5. Wet chemical extinguishing systems, NFPA 17A.

Exceptions:

II Illlnelus'e of e;slsltmgllile supplelssl |e|_|s| systems l';“"” bl 6-continuad-whers
2 1. Factory-built commercial cooking recirculating systems that are tested

in accordance with UL 197 and listed, labeled and installed in accordance
with Section 304.1 of the International Mechanical Code.

Q. Section 906.1 is amended to read as follows:

906.1 Where required. Portable fire extinguishers shall be installed in the
following locations:

*

1.InallGroup A, B, E, F, H, I, M, R-1, R-2, R-4 and S occupancies.

2. Within 30 feet (9114 mm) of commercial cooking equipment.

19



JRIGINAL

3. In areas where flammable or combustible liquids are stored, used or
dispensed. -

4. On each floor of structures under construction, except Group R-3
occupancies, in accordance with Section 1415.1.

5. Where required by the sections indicated in Table 906.1.

6. Special hazard areas, including but not limited to laboratories, computer
rooms and generator rooms, where required by the fire code official.

U R. New Section 907.2.24 is added to read as follows:

907.2.24 All buildings. All newly constructed buildings with a gross square
footage of 3,000 or greater shall be provided with an approved automatic
and manual fire alarm system.

Exceptions:

A. Group R Division 3 and 4, and Group U Occupancies having adequate
fire flow and approved access.

B. Group R Division 3 and 4 dwelling units shall have interconnected
single station smoke detectors in accordance with RCW 48.48.140 and
WAC 212-10.

M S. Section 1404.5 is amended to read as follows:

1404.5 Fire watch. When required by the fire code official for building
construction or demolition that is hazardous in nature, qualified personnel
shall be provided to serve as an onsite fire watch. Fire watch personnel
shall be provided with at least one approved means for notification of the
fire department and their sole duty shall be to perform constant patrols
and watch for the occurrence of fire.

W.T. Section 2703.9 is amended to read as follows:

2703.9 General safety precautions. General precautions for the safe
storage, handling or care of hazardous materials shall be in accordance
with Sections 2703.9.1 through 2703.9.10.

'X_Q. New Section 2703.9.10 is added to read as follows:

20

< s
gt

3

O



IRIGINAL

2703.9.10 Manufacturer’s Limitations. The storage and use of hazardous
materials shall not exceed the manufacturer’s limitations on shelf life and
any other restrictions on use.

Y. V. Sections 3204.3.1.1, 3404.2.9.5.1, 3406.2.4.4, and 3804.2 are amended
to designate the applicable areas as the city of Shoreline, except as allowed by
the fire code official.

21



. B

:
:
:

2
8

2 D



TRIGINAL

23



